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Changes of Latitude Bring 
Changes of Attitude at EJ

It happens. You make a move to a bigger and better facility 
and it gives you the opportunity to provide your customers 
with an even more superior, upgraded service. This is the 
story at EJ and their move from Geebung to Brendale north  
of Brisbane has rolled out smoothly.

It’s exciting times for everyone at EJ as the team settles in 
unpacking boxes and familiarising themselves with new state 
of the art equipment that’s going to provide customers with 
an even more streamlined delivery of service.

The stockpiles of product have been corralled and 
orchestrated to more efficiently integrate with our inventory 
management system, to speed up delivery. You don’t need to 
wait weeks or months as you may with other companies. We 

most likely have what you need in stock in our yard. If not, our 
delivery regimen is second to none. Obviously, customised 
product will still need a little more time but compare our 
delivery times with others. We will always do the best.

Adjacent to the sprawling stockyard stacked high with 
ready-to-haul product and the new offices is a fully equipped 
Al Fresco Deck where we conduct exclusive Lunch’n’Learn 
sessions, featuring latest innovations from EJ. 

Our new Brendale facility has it all. It’s our launching pad for a 
resolute assault on the market. Before you place an order, 
place a call to us on 07 3216 5000 or contact your nearest EJ 
branch. Our attitude means business!

Early in the year and we’re moving the stock already.




